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We remember in prayer:
                                                 
                                                 Boherlahan

Sat 27 Aug 7.30pm     Dinny O’Dwyer, Kilbreedy.

Sun 4 Sept 10.00am    Bro. Pakie Ryan (Mason), Ballyroe and Nenagh.

Tues 6 Sept 10.00am   Patrick O’Dwyer, Thurlesbeg.


                                                   Dualla


Sat 27 Aug 6.30pm     Jimmy O’Gorman, Ballinure

Sun 28 Aug 11.00am  Pakie Moloney, Ballytarsna.

Pray for: Ellen Carmody, Clonoulty and Kerry.


Mon 29 Aug is the feast of The Passion of St. John the Baptist. It is also 
the anniversary of the Episcopal Ordination of Most Rev. Kieran 
O’Reilly SMA, 29 August 2010.


Thurs 1 Sept is the World Day of Prayer for the Care of Creation. It 
offers all of us a precious opportunity to renew our participation as 
custodians of creation. Let us together raise our thanks to God for the 
marvellous works he has entrusted to our care and let us invoke his help 
for the protection of that creation. (Pope Francis)


Sat 3 Sept is the feast of St. Gregory the Great, Pope and Doctor of the 
Church.

 


Holy Communion Ministers (on duty next weekend)

Boherlahan: Carlyn Hyde                                                                             

Dualla: Marie O’Gorman
                                                                                                             




Ministers for the Month of September:

Boherlahan
Collectors:

Sun      Main Aisle                              St Joseph’s                 Our Lady’s

             John Paul Dwyer                    Pio Delaney                 Betty Carew

Readers:  (Sun. 10.00 am) Fergus O’Dwyer and Elaine Fitzgerald.

Dualla
Readers: (Sat. 6:30 pm) Peter Gleeson.
Altar Society: Kathleen O’Donnell; Nora O’Connor; Breda Ryan.
Collectors: (Sat. 6:30 pm) Catherine Hayes; Breda Ryan.
 

Weekend Masses: Boherlahan and Dualla. From the beginning of 
September there will be just one Mass in each church at the weekend. The 
Saturday evening Mass will be celebrated in Dualla at 6.30pm. and the 
Sunday morning Mass in Boherlahan at 10.00am. I know these new 
arrangements will inconvenience some and I do thank you for your 
cooperation.

 

Holycross Abbey Solemn Novena will commence on Thursday 8 
September and will conclude on Friday 16 September. Details of all 
Masses and devotions on the Notice Board.

 

First Friday: The priests will make the usual contact with the sick and the 
housebound this week. Mass and Confessions in both churches, in Dualla 
at 9.30am. and in Boherlahan at 10.15am.

 

Schools Reopening: Scoil San Isadoir, Boherlahan and Little Flower, 
Ballytarsna will open on Wed. 31 August. Dualla N.S. reopens on 
Thursday 1 September.We bid a fond farewell to Mary O’Donnell, 
Principal of Scoil San Isadoir. She has done wonderful work there and we 
wish her well in her retirement from the classroom.We welcome our new 
Principal Catherine Cleary. We pray for a happy and rewarding new school 
year for all involved in education in our parish.

 

Newsletter Notices:Please forward by Wednesday evening any items for 
the Newsletter to Fr. Egan at the email address: frjoeegan@gmail.com.

 


mailto:frjoeegan@gmail.com


Celtic Brothers: in concert, Friday 30 September at The Cathedral of the 
Assumption, Thurles. See further details on the Notice Board.

 
Our Lady of Fatima National Pilgrimage will take place on Sunday 28th 
August at Holycross Abbey. Ceremonies commence at 2.30pm. with the 
Rosary followed by Stations of the Cross. Mass and Anointing of the Sick 
at 4pm. All are welcome.

 

Dualla Show 2022: takes place this Sunday; gates open at 10am. 
Returning are the stars of Country Music Live in Dualla and also the Free 
Big Top Circus; Live at the Marquee featuring cookery, gardening etc. plus 
Tipperary Truck Show, Grand Prix Show Jumping and Livestock Show. 
Old favourites such as Tractor Pulling, Vintage Machinery displays, Dog 
Show etc. will also return.All children under 16 will have FREE 
admission. All inflatables, kids train, etc. will be provided FREE on the 
day. Fast Pass Tickets are available for online purchase. For more 
information see www.duallashow.ie.

 

Farewell to Fr. Tom Dunne.: This weekend we say farewell and thanks to 
Fr. Tom for his loyal and dedicated service in the parish over the last 
almost seven years. We congratulate him on his appointment as P.P. of the 
parish of Murroe and Boher. We wish him good health, good friendship, 
peace and happiness in his new assignment. Personally I thank him for his 
friendship, cooperation and support to me at all times. We pray God’s 
blessing on you in your future work in the Archdiocese.

 

The Community Website: at www.boherlahandualla.ie has photos and a 
report about a visit from the USA to Tobberadora Monument and adjacent 
old forge by a granddaughter of Thady Flanagan: one of the hurlers whose 
achievements are commemorated there.We also have a photo from the 
recent repainting of the front of Bianconi Coach House in Boherlahan 
village. Please send any material for the website to 
editor@boherlahandualla.ie.
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